BAKERSFIELD CITY SCHOOL DISTRICT
Award Sheet Bid #24-04-12

BCSD MISCELLANEOUS ELECTRONICS BID #24-04-12
Line No. Item Description Total Unit Cost
DJ Mix Table
1 Hercules - DJ Control Inpulse 500 DJ Mixer - Black| $ - S - S - S - S 325.00
DJC-INPULSE-500

Podcast Station Mixer #Black MIXCAST 4
2 Podcast production of up to 4 people: 4 mic $ R $ - $ R $ - $ 365.00
inputs with auto-mix, 4 headphone outputs

Audio Equipment - Portable Line Array Sound
System--DISTRICT WILL PROVIDE 1 FOR EACH
SITE

Anchor Audio BIG-QUAD-HHHH Bigfoot 2 Quad

S - S 4,29511 (S - S - S  3,965.50

Power Amplifier Crown #XLS2502

Dual: 1200W S - S 790.99 | $ 1,717.21 (S 617.52 | S 625.00

USB Microphone #SAQ2UHD

> Samson - Q2U Dynamic USB Microphone 5 Rk Cos 1453909 ey ¢ 80.00

Vocal Booth--Clearsonic Isopact
. Foldable 3-section clear shield in front, with ¢ ¢ ¢ 531.88 | $ ¢ 0
SORBER baffles on the inside and as a lid. ) i ’ i ’

(Dark Gray)

Cotton Candy Machine
7 No Bid, Choose a Vendor and Submit Requisition | $ - S - S - S - S -

Popcorn Machine
8 No Bid, Choose a Vendor and Submit Requisition | $ - S - S - S - S -

Device Cart - 30 Unit Prewired--Lockncharge
9 #10370 S - S - S - S 2,777.03 (S 2,461.84
Identify for Apple Products or Chromebooks

10 Device Cart - 30 Unit Lockncharge #10135 $ R $ - $ R $ 1,51829 | $  1,345.97

11 Device Cart - 32 Unit--Spectrum #55429 - s _ s - s 1,563.15 s 1,406.84

12 Device Cart - 35 Unit $ - |$ - [s - |S 1529475 -
Device Cart - 40 unit Prewired Lockncharge

13 #10371 S - S - S - S 3,38469 (S 3,000.54
Identify for Apple Products or Chromebooks

14 Device Cart - 40 Unit Lockncharge #10141 $ - s - s - |s 1,73531|% 1,538.36

15 Device Cart - 45 Unit Anywhere Cart AC-45 $ _ $ _ $ _ $  1,240.00 | ¢ _

Multimedia - Production Kit

9' x 60" Green Screen Backdrop Cloth
HamiltonBuhl Media Production Ultra-Deluxe
Studio Kit MPSK-XL, or equal

16 $ - s - s - s - 1S 790.00

Photography - DSLR Camera

Canon - EOS Rebel T7 DSLR Video Two Lens Kit
17 with EF-S 18-55mm and EF 75-300mm Lenses $ - $ - S - $ - $ 630.00
2727C021

Photography - Photo Booth 360
18 No Bid, Choose a Vendor and Submit Requisition | S - S - S = S - $ -

Photobooth 360 Automatic 46" Platform
19 No Bid, Choose a Vendor and Submit Requisition $ _ $ _ $ _ $ _ $ _




Portable Photobooth Package

20 No Bid, Choose a Vendor and Submit Requisition - $ . $ - $ . $ -
Garment Printer Ink No Bid, Choose a Vendor
and Submit Requisition
2 Epson DTG Ink UltraChrome DG Ink Cartridge k E k e :
1.5L Bag for F3070 EPSON-DG-T47X12N
Printer - Garment Printer No Bid, Choose a
. Vendor and Submit Requisition s s ¢ s
Epson SureColor F3070 Industrial Direct-to- ) : ) i )
Garment Printer
Large Format Ink No Bid, Choose a Vendor and
23 Submit Requisition - S - S - S - S -
Canon PFI-120 Cyan, Magenta, Yellow, Black
Large Format Inkjet Printer No Bid, Choose a
o Vendor and Submit Requisition s s s s
Canon imagePROGRAF TM-350 36" Large Format
Printer 6246C002AA
Bond Paper Roll No Bid, Choose a Vendor and
Submit Requisition
25 Canon Economy Bond Paper (36"x150') - $ ; $ - $ ; s -
3853A011AA
Polypropylene Roll No Bid, Choose a Vendor and
Submit Requisition
26 Resi SE s K s -
Canon Water-Resistant Matte Polypropylene
(36" x 100' Roll) 1514C003AA
Screen - Inflatable 20' Vivohome #X0029LWS80T
27 - S - S - S - S 195.00
Sewing - Sewing and Embroidery Machine No
28 Bid, Choose a Vendor and Submit Requisition - S - s - ]S - s =
Brother SE200
Sewing - Sewing Machine No Bid, Choose a
29 Vendor and Submit Requisition - $ - $ - $ - $ -
Brother Sewing Machine XM2701
Speaker - Bluetooth Small
30 Anker Soundcore Mini 3 Pro . 5 . 5 . $ 26.75 | 5 50.00
31 Speaker - Bluetooth Large JBL boombox 3 S - s S - s 530.00
32 Tablets - E-Reader Nook Glowlight 4e : $ ) $ ) $ ) $ 130.00
33 Television - 45" Sansung QM43C 599.00 | $ 84626 |$ 68349 |$ 63961 (S  532.00
34 Television - 55" Samsung QM55C 867.00 [ $ 1,27005 |$ 1,08161|$ 92200 |$  822.27
35 Television - 65" Viewsonic #CDE5530 1,245.00 | $ 1,831.55 [$ 93565 |$  1,427.28 [$  1,137.01
36 Television - 75" Viewsonic #CDE7530 1,040.00 | $ 3,288.78 |$ 122062 |$ 261642 |$ 1,701.41
Television - Mobile Cart Soundbar Attachment
37 Copernicus Sound Bar Mount for iRover2 - IFP- 65.00 | $ - s - s S -
ACS2
Television - Mobile Cart
38 Copernicus iRover2 for Interactive Flat Panels - 1,179.00 | $ - $ - $ - $ _
IFP500
Television - Mount Articulating
39 Premier Articulating Mount for Flat Panels - S 156.25 | S 13043 | S 13260 | $ 132.00

#AMO5




Television - Mount Low Profile Swingout #AM100
Premier Low Profile Ultra-Slim Swingout Mount

40 S 49750 | $ 419.81 | S 41798 | $ 422.34
for Flat Panels
o Television - Mount Lowprofile ¢ 177.50 |8 147.33 | ¢ 12077 | ¢ 148.22
Premier LowProfile Mount P5080F ’ ’ ’ '
Television - Mount Swingout
42 Premier Swingout Mount for Flat Panels up to $ 560.00 | $ 472,09 | ¢ 47873 | ¢ 475.00
300lbs #AM300-B or Equal
Notes:
Awarded

No Vendor Bid
No Bid Pricing




	Misc. Equipment Award Sheet

